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COMPLAINT POLICY- STUDENTS 
 
The Jackson Public School District Board of Trustees will use the following 
procedure for any grievance of any nature to include, but not limited to, alleged 
discrimination based on the grounds of race, color, handicap, sex, religion, creed, 
national origin, or age.  For further information contact Title IX coordinator. 
When a student has a grievance, he or she shall, within five working days of 
when the grievance is first known, request a conference with Title IX coordinator.  
This conference shall be scheduled by the Title IX coordinator within five working 
days of receipt of the request.  If the grievance is resolved at this conference by 
mutual agreement, there shall be no further action.  Both parties shall state in 
writing that they are in agreement with the proposed resolution. 
 
If the grievance is not resolved at the first level conference, the student shall file, 
within five working days, with the assistant superintendent, a written description 
of the grievance.  Upon receipt of the grievance, the assistant superintendent 
and the Title IX coordinator shall schedule a conference with the student to be 
held within five working days of the receipt of the grievance.  This conference 
shall be for the purpose of resolving the field grievance.  Following the 
conference, the assistant superintendent shall respond in writing within five 
working days to the student as to his or her decision regarding the disposition of 
the grievance. 
 
Should the grievance not be resolved to the satisfaction of the student, he or she 
may continue through each level of administration in the same manner as 
prescribed heretofore.  Upon completion of the final administrative level, the 
superintendent of education, the student may request to be heard by the board of 
trustees by submitting the request in writing to the superintendent.  The 
superintendent shall insert in the appropriate place on the agenda of the next 
board meeting (provided that the time constraints, as per board policy, are met 
for inclusion on the most immediate agenda) an item which states that the 
student desires to address the board concerning a grievance. 
 
The board shall review the original grievance.  In addition, the board may, but is 
not required to, hear directly from any individual with knowledge of any relevant 
facts relating to the grievance.  The board shall make a decision regarding the 
merits of the grievance within five working days of its hearing. 
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